
Bid 09-166
Distribution System Repairs Capital Improvements

Position
Regular

$/hr
Overtime

$/hr
Night Shift

$/hr
Holiday

$/hr Position
Regular

$/hr
Overtime

$/hr
Night Shift

$/hr
Holiday

$/hr Position
Regular

$/hr
Overtime

$/hr
Night Shift

$/hr
Holiday

$/hr
Foreman $55.00 $82.50 $82.50 $110.00 Foreman $50.00 $75.00 $55.00 $100.00 Foreman $53.00 $79.50 $79.50 $106.00
Truck Driver $32.50 $48.75 $48.75 $65.00 Truck Driver $31.00 $46.50 $34.10 $62.00 Truck Driver $37.00 $55.50 $55.50 $74.00
Operator $43.50 $65.25 $65.25 $87.00 Operator $40.00 $60.00 $44.00 $80.00 Operator $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $100.00

Laborer $32.50 $48.75 $48.75 $65.00 Laborer $28.00 $42.00 $30.80 $56.00 Laborer $38.00 $57.00 $57.00 $76.00
Welder $45.00 $67.50 $67.50 $90.00 Welder $50.00 $75.00 $55.00 $100.00 Welder $48.00 $72.00 $72.00 $96.00
Carpenter $35.00 $52.50 $52.50 $70.00 Carpenter $40.00 $60.00 $44.00 $80.00 Carpenter $46.00 $69.00 $69.00 $92.00

Electrician $46.00 $69.00 $69.00 $92.00 Electrician $60.00 $90.00 $66.00 $120.00 Electrician $50.00 $75.00 $75.00 $100.00
Plumber $45.00 $67.50 $67.50 $90.00 Plumber $60.00 $90.00 $66.00 $120.00 Plumber $52.00 $78.00 $78.00 $104.00
Metal Worker $45.00 $67.50 $67.50 $90.00 Metal Worker $60.00 $90.00 $66.00 $120.00 Metal Worker $48.00 $72.00 $72.00 $96.00

Pipe Fitter $45.00 $67.50 $67.50 $90.00 Pipe Fitter $60.00 $90.00 $66.00 $120.00 Pipe Fitter $52.00 $78.00 $78.00 $104.00

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Equipment
Hourly

$/hr
Daily
$/day

Weekly
$/wk Equipment

Hourly
$/hr

Daily
$/day

Weekly
$/wk Equipment

Hourly
$/hr

Daily
$/day

Weekly
$/wk

Air Compressor (200 cfm) $15.00 $120.00 $600.00 Air Compressor (200 cfm) $20.00 $160.00 $800.00 Air Compressor (200 cfm) $21.00 $166.00 $828.00
Air Compressor (600 cfm) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Air Compressor (600 cfm) $68.00 $544.00 $2,720.00 Air Compressor (600 cfm) $67.00 $534.00 $2,668.00

Jack Hammer $5.00 $40.00 $200.00 Jack Hammer $10.00 $80.00 $400.00 Jack Hammer $12.00 $92.00 $460.00

Crawler Crane (12-1/2 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid Crawler Crane (12-1/2 ton) (6) (6) (6) Crawler Crane (12-1/2 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crawler Crane (25 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid Crawler Crane (25 ton) (6) (6) (6) Crawler Crane (25 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Crawler Crane (48 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid Crawler Crane (48 ton) (6) (6) (6) Crawler Crane (48 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Truck Crane (12-1/2 ton) $90.00 $720.00 $3,600.00 Truck Crane (12-1/2 ton) (6) (6) (6) Truck Crane (12-1/2 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck Crane (25 ton) $100.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 Truck Crane (25 ton) (6) (6) (6) Truck Crane (25 ton) No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pile Hammer with leads $70.00 $560.00 $2,800.00 Pile Hammer with leads No Bid No Bid No Bid Pile Hammer with leads No Bid No Bid No Bid

Water Pump – gasoline (2”) $15.00 $120.00 $600.00 Water Pump – gasoline (2”) $10.00 $80.00 $320.00 Water Pump – gasoline (2”) $12.00 $92.00 $460.00
Water Pump – gasoline (3”) $20.00 $160.00 $800.00 Water Pump – gasoline (3”) $12.00 $96.00 $480.00 Water Pump – gasoline (3”) $14.00 $112.00 $560.00
Water Pump – gasoline (4”) $29.00 $232.00 $1,160.00 Water Pump – gasoline (4”) $32.00 $256.00 $1,280.00 Water Pump – gasoline (4”) $35.00 $280.00 $1,400.00

Submersible Electric Pump (2-1/2 hp) $25.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 Submersible Electric Pump (2-1/2 hp) $25.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 Submersible Electric Pump (2-1/2 hp) $29.00 $232.00 $1,160.00
Submersible Electric Pump (15 hp) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 Submersible Electric Pump (15 hp) $35.00 $280.00 $1,400.00 Submersible Electric Pump (15 hp) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00

Dozer (Cat D5) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Dozer (Cat D5) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Dozer (Cat D5) $64.00 $512.00 $2,560.00
Dozer (Cat D8) $150.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 Dozer (Cat D8) $150.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 Dozer (Cat D8) $173.00 $1,384.00 $6,920.00
Backhoe (Case 580) $26.00 $208.00 $1,040.00 Backhoe (Case 580) $30.00 $240.00 $1,200.00 Backhoe (Case 580) $30.00 $240.00 $1,200.00
Backhoe (Bantam 151)  PC128       (1) $75.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 Backhoe (Bantam 151) No Bid No Bid No Bid Backhoe (Bantam 151) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Backhoe (Cat 225)  PC228             (2) $100.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 Backhoe (Cat 225) $85.00 $680.00 $3,400.00 Backhoe (Cat 225) $110.00 $880.00 $4,400.00
Hoe (Cat 350)  PC400                    (3) $150.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 Hoe (Cat 350) $150.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 Hoe (Cat 350) $175.00 $1,400.00 $11,200.00

Backhoe (Ho-Ram Attached) $45.00 $360.00 $1,800.00 Backhoe (Ho-Ram Attached) $45.00 $360.00 $1,800.00 Backhoe (Ho-Ram Attached) $52.00 $416.00 $2,080.00
Front-End Loader (Cat 955L)  953   (4) $68.00 $544.00 $2,720.00 Front-End Loader (Cat 955L) $75.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 Front-End Loader (Cat 955L) $90.00 $720.00 $3,600.00
Front-End Loader (1 CY tired)  WA 180    (5) $56.00 $448.00 $2,240.00 Front-End Loader (1 CY tired) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Front-End Loader (1 CY tired) $90.00 $720.00 $3,600.00

200 Amp Welder $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 200 Amp Welder *Includes Welding Truck (7) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 200 Amp Welder $52.00 $416.00 $2,080.00

Truck (1/2 ton pickup) $14.00 $112.00 $560.00 Truck (1/2 ton pickup) $14.00 $112.00 $560.00 Truck (1/2 ton pickup) $14.00 $112.00 $560.00
Truck (Ho-Ram) No Bid No Bid No Bid Truck (Ho-Ram) No Bid No Bid No Bid Truck (Ho-Ram) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Truck (1 ton utility) $20.00 $160.00 $800.00 Truck (1 ton utility) $20.00 $160.00 $800.00 Truck (1 ton utility) $21.00 $168.00 $840.00
Truck (6 CY dump) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 Truck (6 CY dump) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 Truck (6 CY dump) $67.00 $536.00 $2,680.00
Truck (10 CY dump) $72.00 $576.00 $2,880.00 Truck (10 CY dump) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Truck (10 CY dump) $78.00 $624.00 $3,120.00
Truck (Tandem dump) No Bid No Bid No Bid Truck (Tandem dump) $60.00 $480.00 $2,400.00 Truck (Tandem dump) $78.00 $624.00 $3,120.00
Truck (Tool trailer) $15.00 $120.00 $600.00 Truck (Tool trailer) $10.00 $80.00 $400.00 Truck (Tool trailer) $21.00 $168.00 $840.00
Truck (Fuel) $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 Truck (Fuel) $20.00 $160.00 $800.00 Truck (Fuel) $44.00 $352.00 $1,760.00

Pipe saw with Blades $16.00 $128.00 $640.00 Pipe Saw $12.00
Street Saw with Blades $30.00 $240.00 $1,200.00 Pavement Saw $29.00
Water Truck $30.00 $240.00 $1,200.00 Street Broom $40.00
Vacuum Excavator $40.00 $320.00 $1,600.00 Light Plant $20.00
Fusion Truck with Pools $35.00 $280.00 $1,400.00 Vacuum Excavator $48.00
Trac-Star Fusion Machine 6"-12" $35.00 $280.00 $1,400.00
1720 Directional Drill (Dirt) $120.00 $960.00 $4,800.00
2720 Directional Drill (Dirt) $150.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00
2720 Directional Drill (Rock Pull back up to 8" 
Pipe; Poly or Fusible Pull) $220.00 $1,760.00 $8,800.00

Note:

(1) Bidder took exception to description, changed to  PC128 
(2) Bidder took exception to description, changed to  PC228 
(3) Bidder took exception to description, changed to  PC400
(4) Bidder took exception to description, changed to  953
(5) Bidder took exception to description, changed to  WA180
(6) Bidder noted that rental on crane varies w/distance and set up requirements. Rate is rental cost  plus 10%.
(7) Bidder added notation to include welding truck

Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List)

Note (6): Rental on Crane varies w/distance and set up requirements. Rate is rental cost  
plus 10%.

Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List) Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List) Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List)

Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List) Any miscellaneous labor rates (Please List)

Equipment Rates
November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011

Note (1): Bidder marked through and made changes to equipment

Equipment Rates
November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011

T & C Contracting, Inc.

Equipment Rates
November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011

Labor Rates
November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011

MAC Construction Southern Pipeline Construction, Co.
Labor Rates

November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011
Labor Rates

November 1, 2009 - October 31, 2011


