LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
Bid 08-208 / New Services

Bid Opening Date: 12/10/2008
Prevailing Wages Required: No

**The presence of this bid tabulation is not an express or implied representation by the Louisville Water Co., and must not be interpreted as a guarantee, endorsement, or warranty of contract award and may
not result in contract award. This bid is currently under review and requires approval(s) before final contract award is authorized.***

) . . . Southern Pipeline Const. Co.
Debbie Sutherland Tom Brown Construction | T& C Contracting, Inc. ~ |Basham Construction & Rental Miller Pipeline Corp. (CWBE)
BIDDERS 58?5?32?%%%? | 706 Natie Tumpike | Lo B0 238 1Fl<?2dS|°UIQYPifglFig- 8850 Crawfordsvile Rd. | 1272 Old Fer Valley Ral
: ouisville, airdale, ; i isvi
Shepherdsville, KY 40165 Louisville, KY 40214 1,280 U] Indianapolis, IN' 46234 LOU'SV('I:E(’ )KJG)40219
(4), (5),
BID CATEGORIES
Installation of 3/4-Inch & 1-Inch Water Service Connections $374,750.00 $458,900.00 $673,800.00 $601,800.00 No Bid $791,320.00
Estimate $300,000 - $500,000
Installation of 1 1/2-inch & 2-inch Water Service Connections )
Estimate $100,000 - $250,000 $119,100.00 $133,480.00 $196,300.00 $178,425.00 No Bid $331,590.00
Installation of 4-inch & Larger Water Service Connections )
Estimate $80,000 - $100,000 $71,325.00 $72,950.00 $132,200.00 (3) $114,800.00 No Bid $138,595.00 (4)
Installation of Fire Service Connections .
Estimate $200,000 - $300,000 $179,100.00 $171,400.00 $325,650.00 $275,050.00 No Bid $436,167.00
Installation of Fire Hydrants )
Estimate $20,000 - $40,000 $17,435.00 $17,950.00 $27,140.00 $24,320.00 No Bid $31,229.90 (6)
Renewal of 3/4-inch & 1-inch Water Service Connections '
Estimate $20,000 - $50,000 $53,560.00 $54,050.00 $61,270.00 $61,670.00 No Bid $87,989.00
Discontinuing Small Water Services
Estimate $25,000 - $50,000 $61,550.00 $59,400.00 $55,190.00 $72,600.00 $96,575.00 $125,803.00
Start / Complete Dates Begin January 1, 2009 Begin January 1, 2009 Begin January 1, 2009 Begin January 1, 2009 Begin January 1, 2009 Begin January 1, 2009
P Complete December 31, 2009 | Complete December 31, 2009| Complete December 31, 2009| Complete December 31, 2009 | Complete December 31, 2009 | Complete December 31, 2009
Bid Signed YES YES YES YES YES YES
Acknowledge Receipt of Addendum No. 1 YES YES YES YES (7) YES YES
GFE Documentation Included YES YES YES YES YES YES

Planholders that did not submit a bid: Advanced Paving & Construction, Akerman Construction Co., American Contracting & Services, Aqua Utility Services, LLC, Atlas Excavating, Berry Contracting, Branham Bobcat & Excavating, Branham Excavating, Bright Construction, Buky Construction,
C&W Construction, CP Systems, C Squared, Cleary Construction, Contracting Assistance, Inc. Cornell Harbison, Culver & Associates, Cundiff Contracting, Dan Cristiani, E Z Construction, Filcon Construction, Fishel Co., Flynn Brothers Contracting, Garrison Construction, GBMC, Inc., Gohmann
Asphalt, Hall Contracting, Hanka Builders, Hidden Hollow Construction, Holloway Contracting, Infrastructure Systems, J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Jeff Botner Excavating, Jeff Robards Construction, Kelsey Construction, Landscape Sprinkler, Larry Clark Construction, Larry Smith Contractors, Larry
W. Doyle & Assocs., Lawrence Construction & Leasing, Louis D. Powell Excavating, Louisville Paving, M. Griffith Plumbing & Piping, MAC Construction, Morgan Contracting, MRK Co., MTN Construction, Phillip R. Thompson, Inc., RAM Engineering, Reynolds, Inc., Nutt Construction, PACE
Contracting, S & S and Assocs., Sang Corp.(CMBE), Schardein Mechanical, Scott & Ritter, Simplex Grinnell, LP, Smith Contractors, Springfield Plumbing, SRS, Inc., Team Contracting, Three T Construction, WHF, Inc., W. L. Hailey & Co., Garney Companies, Herrick Co.,

Hussung Mechanical, United Construction & Design

Apparent Best Bidder(s): Debbie Sutherland Excavating, Tom Brown Construction, and T & C Contracting
Buyer's Name: Greta Howard
Project Manager's Name: Eric Ayers

(1) Obvious arithmetic error in Unit Prices. Amount corrected from $29,000 to $25,000. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(2) Obvious arithmetic error in Unit Prices. Amount corrected from $20,000 to $2,000. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(3) Due to obvious arithmetic errors in Projected Cost of two Unit Prices, the total for this bid category has been changed from $150,200 to $132,200. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(4) Obvious arithmetic error in Total for Bid Category. Amount corrected from $138,605 to $138,595. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(5) Obvious arithmetic error in Unit Prices. Amount corrected from $1,485. 00 to $0.00. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(6) Due to obvious arithmetic error in Projected Cost of item 8a. under bid category New Fire Hydrants, the total for this bid category has been changed from $32,714.90 to $31,229.90 Correction does not affect outcome of bid.

(7) Bidder did not acknowledge receipt of Addendum at Bid Opening. PerPurchasing Procedures, Section 12, bidder was immediately contacted and acknowledged receipt of Addendum 1. Correction does not affect outcome of bid.



